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BID TABULATION

REMINGTON & VERNICK ENGINEERS

PROJECT NAME: INFILTRATION AND INFLOW (i&1) REMEDIATION

PROJECT NUMBER: 0436T280

CLIENT: TOWNSHIP OF WINSLOW

Standard Pipe Services, LLC

567 Walther Road

Newark, DE 19702

302-256-0701
{(BB, CS, 58, els.)

#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY
8 UNITS

UNITS
PRICE

TOTAL

856-697-1000
{{BB, CS, 55, etc.)

Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe
1566 Harding Highway
Newfield, NJ 08344

UNITS
FPRICE

TOTAL

Contract #4: Eastmont Lane - Pipe Replacement

MOBILIZATION (MAXIMUM BID
AMOUNT IS PER NJAC 7:14-2.9;
COPY ENCLOSED IN
SPECIFICATIONS)

0,00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

PRE & POST CONSTRUCTION
CLEANING & TELEVISING, 8-INCH
SANITARY SEWER

620 LF

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

OPEN CUT - REMOVE DOUBLE
BAG; HAUL AND DISPOSE OF
EXISTING 8-INCH ACP SANITARY
SEWER AND PROVIDE 8-iNCH
PVC SDR-35 SANITARY SEWER, 0
- & DEEP

32 LF

$0.00

$0.00

PROVIDE RECONNECTION OF
PIPE TO EXISTING MANHOLE

$0.C0

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

REMOVE EXISTING SANITARY
SEWER LATERAL AND PROVIDE
NEW 4" PVC LATERAL, DEPTH OF

5C LF

$0.60

$0.00

$0.0¢

$0.60

DEWATERING SYSTEM,
COMPLETE

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.¢0

TRENCH STABILIZATION (IF &
WHERE DIRECTED) {MIN. BID
PRICE = §6.00/CY)

18 CY

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

SELECT BACKFILL (IF & WHERE
DIREGTED) (MIN. BID PRICE =
$6.00/CY)

75 CY

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE
BASE COURSE, 4" THICK {MIN.
BID PRICE = $5.00/8Y)

5G sY

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

10

HOT MIX ASPHALT MiX 19M64,
BASE COURSE, 6" THICK {MIN.
BID PRICE = $11.50/5Y)

50 SY

§0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

MILL 2" AND OVERLAY WITH HOT
MEX ASPHALT MIX 9.5M64,
SURFACE COURSE, 2" THICK
{MIN. BID PRICE = $8.00/SY)

175 3Y

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

12

ALLOWANCE, UNIFCRM POLICE
TRAFFIC CONTROL, IF & WHERE
DIRECTED BY THE GWNER

40 HR

$0.00

$0.00

13

ENVIRONMENTAL & CULTURAL
RESOURCE PROTECTION AND

RESTORATICN {MINIMUM LUMP
SUM BID OF $1,000.00)

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

14

MAINTENANCE & PROTECTION
OF TRAFFIC

$0.00

TEST PITS FOR EXISTING
LATERAL ALIGNMENT/DEPTH AT
PROPOSED CLEANOUT

10 CcYy

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

"INJEIT PROJECT SIGN

$6.00

$0.00

17

ALLOWANCE, ROAD OPENING /
CONSTRUCTION PERMITS IF &
WHERE DIRECTED BY THE
OWNER

$0.00

$0.00

18

RESTORATIONS (MINIMUM LUMP
SUM BID OF $3,000.00)

$0.00

$0.00

... 50.00 |

$0.00
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R |REMINGTON & VERNICK ENGINEERS
ViBID TABULATION

PROJECT NAME: INFILTRATION AND INFLOW {I&l) REMEDIATION

PROJECT NUMBER: 04367260

CLIENT: TOWNSHIP OF WINSLOW

Standard Pipe Services, LLC
567 Walther Road
Newark, DE 19702

Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe
15686 Harding Highway
Newfield, NJ 08344

302-256-0701 856-697-1900
BB, CS, S8, etc.)) ({B5, €S, S5, ete)
QUANTITY UNITS UNITS
# PESCRIPTICN & UNITS PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COST NO BID NO BID
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REMINGTON & VERNICK ENGINEERS

BID TABULATION

PROJECT NAME: INFILTRATION AND INFLOW (i&1) REMEDIATION

PROJECT NUMBER: 0436T260

CLIENT: TOWNSHIP OF WINSLOW

Standard Pipe Services, LLC

567 Walther Road
Newark, DE 197

302-256-0701
{(BB, €S, §S, elc.)

02

856-697-1800
{(8B, C3, 58, eic))

Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe
1586 Harding Highway
Newfield, NJ 08344

#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY
& UNITS

UNITS
PRICE

TOTAL

UNITS
PRICE

TOTAL

Contract #5: Evergreen Avenue - Pipe Re

lacement

MOBILIZATION {MAXIMUM BID
AMOUNT IS PER NJAC 7:14-2.9;
COPY ENCLOSED iN
SPECIFICATIONS)

$0.00

$0.00

PRE & POST CONSTRUCTION
CLEANING & TELEVISING, 8-INCH
SANITARY SEWER

1170 LF

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

CPEN CUT - REMOVE EXISTING 8
INCH PVC AND PROVIDE 8-INCH
PVC SDR-28, 0 - 16' DEEP

64 LF

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

OPEN CUT - REMOVE EXISTING 8/
INCH PVC AND PROVIDE 8-INCH
PVC SDR-26, >16' DEEP

64 LF

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

§0.00

_{PIPE TO EXISTING MANHOLE

PROVIDE REGONNECTION OF

$0.0C

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

REMOVE EXISTING SANITARY
SEWER LATERAL AND PROVIDE
4" PVC SDR 26 LATERAL, DEPTH
CF 16" OR LESS, FITTINGS,
CLEANOUT, COMPLETE, IF &
WHERE DIRECTED

40 LF

$0.00

$0.00

REMOVE EXISTING SANITARY
SEWER LATERAL AND PROVIDE
4" PVC SDR 26 LATERAL, DEPTH
OF »16', FITTINGS, CLEANOUT,
CASTING, COMPLETE, IF &
WHERE DIRECTED

40 LF

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$6.00

$0.00

BYPASS PUMPING SYSTEM, IF &
WHERE DIRECTED

$0.00

$0.00

$6.00

$0.00

7a

DEWATERING SYSTEM,
COMPLETE

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

TRENCH STABILIZATION (IF &
WHERE DIRECTED) {MIN. BID
PRICE = $5.00/CY)

50 cY

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

SELECT BACKFILL (IF & WHERE
DIREGTED) (MIN. BID PRICE =
$6.00/CY)

550 cY

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

10

DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE
BASE GOURSE, 4" THIGK (MIN.
BID PRICE = $5.00/SY)

11

400 3y

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

HOT MiX ASPHALT MIX 15654,
BASE COURSE, 8" THICK {(MIN.
BID PRICE = $11.50/SY}

400 SY

12

MILL 2" AND OVERLAY WITH HOT
MIX ASPHALT MIX 9.5M64,
SURFACE COURSE, 2" THICK
{MIN. BID PRICE = $8.00/8Y)

13

ALLOWANCE, UNIFORM POLICE
TRAFFIC CONTROL, IF & WHERE
DIRECTED BY THE OWNER

450 sY

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.60

40 HR

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

14

ENVIRONMENTAL & CULTURAL
RESCURCE PRCTECTION AND
RESTORATION (MINIMUM LUMP

SUM BID OF $1,000.00)

$0.00

$0.00
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BID TABULATION

REMINGTON & VERNICK ENGINEERS

PROJECT NAME: INFILTRATION AND INFLOW (1&1) REMEDIATION

PROJECT NUMBER: (438T260

CLIENT: TOWNSHIP OF WINSLOW

Standard Pipe Services, LLC
567 Waither Read
Newark, DE 19702

302-256-0701
{(BB, C8, 85, etc.))

Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe
1566 Harding Highway
Newfield, NJ 08344

856-697-1900
{(BB, CS, S5, etc.))

15

DESCRIPTION
MAINTENANGCE & PROTECTION

OF TRAFFIC

QUANTITY
& UNITS

1

LS

UNITS
PRICE

$C.00

TOTAL
$6.00

UNITS
PRICE

$0.00

TOTAL
$0.00

186
17

18

20

21

22

NJEIT PROJECT SIGN

i

LS

$0.00 "$0.00

$0.00 $0.00

TEST PIT TO LOCATE UTILITIES

25

cyY

$0.00 $C.00

$0.00 $0.00

NJPE SIGNED / SEALED DESIGN
OF CONTRACTOR'S SITE
SPECIFIC TRENCH PROTECTIVE
SYSTEMS

LS

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

'REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT

OF 15" CMP STORM SEWER AT
STATION 10+30 EVERGREEN
AVENUE, IF AND WHERE
DIRECTED

LS

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT
OF 18" CMP STORM SEWER AT
STATICN 13+21 EVERGREEN
AVENUE, IF AND WHERE
DIRECTED

LS

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

'ALLOWANCE, RGAD OPENING /

CONSTRUCTION PERMITS IF &
WHERE DIRECTED BY THE
OWNER

LS

$0.00 $G.00

$0.00 $0.00

RESTORATIONS (MINIMUM LUMP
SUM BID OF 54,000,00)

LS

3C.00 $6.00

$0.00 $0.00

TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COST

NO BID

NO BID
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BID TABULATION

REMINGTON & VERNICK ENGINEERS

PROJECT NAME: INFILTRATION AND INFLOW (1&1) REMEDIATION

PROJECT NUMBER: 04367260

CLIENT: TOWNSHIP OF WINSLOW

567 Walther Road

302-256-0701
(BB, CS, S8, ele.))

Standard Pipe Services, LI.C

Newark, DE 19702

#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY
& UNITS

UNITS
PRICE

TOTAL

Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe
1566 Harding Highway
Newfield, NJ 08344

856-697-1900
(BB, G5, 55, et )

UNITS

PRICE TOTAL

Contract #6: South Cedarbrook Road - M

anhole Replaceme

nt

MOBILIZATION {MAXIMUM BID
AMOUNT IS PER NJAC 7:14-2.9;
COPY ENCLOSED IN
SPECIFICATIONS)

1 LS

$0.00

$0.00

$6.00 $0.0C

REMOVE AND REPLACE 4'
DIAMETER SANITARY SEWER
MANHOLE WITH 4' DIAMETER
FLAT TOP MANHOLE WITH PVG
LINER, INCLUDING
CONNECTIONS TO EXISTING
PIPING

$0.00

50.00

$0.00 $0.00

TEMPGORARY BYPASS
CONVEYANCE SYSTEMS,
COMPLETE

$0.00

30.00

$0.00 $0.00

ALLOWANCE, UNIFORM POLICE
TRAFFIC CONTROL, IF & WHERE
DIRECTED BY THE OWNER

72 HR

$0.00

$0.0C

$0.00 $0.00

MAINTENANCE & PROTECTION
OF TRAFFIC

$0.00

$0.00

NJEIT PROJECT SIGN

10

$0.00

$0.00

$0.06 $0.00

50.00 $0.00

ENVIRONMENTAL & CULTURAL
RESQURCE PROTECTION AND

RESTORATION (MINEMUM LUMP
SUM BID OF $1,000.00)

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00 $0.00

ALLOWANCE, ROAD QPENING /
CONSTRUCTION PERMITS IF &
WHERE DIRECTED BY THE
OWNER

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00 $0.00

REMOVE AND REPLACE 8" PVC
SDR 35 SANITARY SEWER MAIN
BETWEEN MANHOLES #3 AND #4,
INCLUDES CONNECTIONS TO
ALL MANHOLES

10 LF

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00 $0.60

RESTORATIONS (MINIMUM LUMP
SUM BID OF $2,000.00)

1085 LS

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00 $0.00

TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COST

NO BB

NO BID
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REMINGTON & VERNICK ENGINEERS

BID TABULATION

PROJECT NAME: INFILTRATION AND INELOW (181) REMEDIATION

PROJECT NUMBER: 04367260

CLIENT: TOWNSHIP OF WINSLOW

Standard Pipe Services, LLC
567 Walther Road
Mewark, DE 19702

302-256-0701
{(BB, CS, 53, elc.))

Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe
1566 Harding Highway
Newfield, NJ 08344

856-687-1900
(BB, CS, S, sic.)

#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY
& UNITS

UNITS
PRICE

TOTAL

UNITS
PRICE

TOTAL

Contract #7: Sassafras Court - Manhole Replacement

MOBILIZATION (MAXIMUM BID
AMCUNT IS PER NJAC 7:14-2.9;
COPY ENCLOSED IN
SPECIFICATIONS)

LS

$0.00

REMOVE AND REPLAGCE 4'
DIAMETER SANITARY SEWER
MANOLE, INCLUDING
CONNECTIONS TO EXISTING
PIPING

UN

$0.00

OPEN CUT - REMOVE EXISTING 8-
INCH PVC AND PRGVIDE 8-INCH
PVC SDR-35, 0 - 8' DEEP

52

LF

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$6.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

TRENCH STABILIZATION (IF &
WHERE DIRECTED} {MIN. BID
PRICE = $6,00/CY}

15

cY

$0.00

SELECT BACKFILL (IF & WHERE
DIRECTED) (MIN. BID PRICE =
$6.00/CY)

55

cY

$0.00

$0.00

50.00

$0.0C

$0.00

$0.00

DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE
BASE COURSE, 4" THICK {MIN.
81D PRICE = $5.00/8Y)

45

SY

$0.00

$0.00

10

"
12

i3

14

15

16

17

HOT MIX ASPHALT MIX 19M64,
BASE COURSE, 8" THICK {MIN.
BID PRICE = $11.50/SY)

45

SY

$0.00

$6.00

$0.00

" $0.00

$0.00

$0.00

MILL 2" AND OVERLAY WITH HOT
MIX ASPHALT MIX 9.5M64,
SURFACE COURSE, 2" THICK
{MIN. BID PRICE = $8.00/SY)

70

sy

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

BYPASS PUMPING SYSTEM, IF &
WHERE DIRECTED

LS

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

ALLOWANGE, UNIFORM POLICE
TRAFFIC CONTROL, IF & WHERE
DIRECTED BY THE OWNER

24

HR

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

MAINTENANCE & PROTECTION
OF TRAFFIC

LS

$0.00

NJEIT PRCJECT SIGN

LS

ENVIRONMENTAL & GULTURAL
RESOURCE PROTECTION AND

RESTORATION (MINIMUM LUMP
SUM BID OF $1,000.00)

LS

$0.00

ALLOWANCE, ROAD CPENING /
CONSTRUCTION PERMITS IF &
WHERE DIRECTED BY THE
OWNER

1.8

$0.00

$0.00

..30.00

$0.00

$0.00

%000}

$0.00

. 3000,

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

RESTORATIONS (MINIMUM LUMP
SUM BID OF $1,000.00)

LS

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

TEST PITS TO DETERMINE TOP
OF EXISTING PIPE ELEVATIONS
AT PROPOSED CONNECTION
POINT WITH NEW PIPING

25

cY

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

POST CONSTRUCTION
CLEANING AND TELEVISING, 8"

SANITARY SEWER

00

LF

$0.00

$0.¢0

$0.00

$0.00

TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COST

NO BID

$0.00
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